
SAPA SOD, PINE STRAW & HAY TABULATION 2018 
March 14, 2018 

Bidder’s Name:  WOERNER TURF 
Contact Information: 

818 N. McKenzie Street 

Foley, AL 36535 

 

                    
Loaded 

Price: 

BALDWIN 

COUNTY 

(Delivery) 

MOBILE 

COUNTY 

(Delivery) 

ESCAMBIA 

COUNTY 

(Delivery) 

Bid Amount  Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY $1.60 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA 6.00 250.00 150.00 150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Tifway 419 Large Roll (42”) SY 1.72 250.00 150.00 150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY $1.60 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Tiffway 419 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA 6.00 250.00 150.00 150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Overseeded with Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Perennial Ryegrass Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Celebration Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY $1.60 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA 6.00 250.00 150.00 150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Centipede Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Centipede Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Construction Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Grade Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Geo Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Emerald Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY $2.60 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Empire Palisade Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA 6.00 250.00 150.00 150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY $2.25 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

St. Augustine Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA 6.00 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Seashore Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Paspalme Large Roll (42”) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY ------ ------ ------ ------ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 



 

(SOD – Continued) 

WOERNER TURF 

 

*Pick-up Locations: 

Multidle, Bon Secour & Foley 

 

*Minimum Order for Delivery 

400 – 500 sy (8-10 pallets) 

 

*Maximum Order for Delivery 

1,000 sq yds 

 

 

 

HAY & PINE STRAW TABULATION 

WOERNER TURF 

 

*NO BID on Hay and Pine Straw 

*NO BID on Sod in Mobile and Escambia Counties 

*For Delivery of Sod in Baldwin County, Allow 48 – 72 Hours 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



SAPA SOD, PINE STRAW & HAY TABULATION 2018 
March 14, 2018 

Bidder’s Name:  EVANS & COMPANY, INC. 
Contact Information: 

7930 Ziegler Blvd, Mobile, AL 

 

                    
Loaded 

Price: 

BALDWIN 

COUNTY 

 

MOBILE 

COUNTY 

 

ESCAMBIA 

COUNTY 

 
Bid Amount  Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Tifway 419 Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Tiffway 419 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Overseeded with Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Perennial Ryegrass Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Celebration Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Centipede Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Centipede Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Construction Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Grade Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Geo Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Emerald Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Empire Palisade Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

St. Augustine Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Seashore Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Paspalme Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 



 

HAY & PINE STRAW TABULATION 

EVANS & COMPANY, INC. 

    

 

            
    

 
           
 
 
    
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

HAY 
 

Dimensions of Bale:  18”x 20”x 40” +/- 
 

Price: $6.00 + $1.00 = $7.00 
 

Quoted in Tractor Trailer Load Deliveries 
 

No Pick Up Price 
 

100 – Bales Minimum Amount 
to be Delivered 

 
3-4 Day Lead Time for Delivery 

 

PINE STRAW 

 
Dimensions of Bale:  14”x 14”x 26” – Rolls- Comp to 14”x 14”x 26” 

 
Price: $6.00 + $1.00 = $7.00 

 
14-Days Lead Time for Delivery 

 
Trailer will be dropped off to work out of until trailer is empty. 

 
900 – 1000 Bales in Trailer (Comparable to 14”x 14”x 26” Bale) 

 
Minimum Amount to be delivered 100 Bales (3-4 Days lead time) 

 
Quoted only in Tractor-Trailer Deliveries.  No Pick-Up Price. 

 
Pine Straw may be picked up at specified Locations 



 

SAPA SOD, PINE STRAW & HAY TABULATION 2018 

Bidder’s Name:  GULF COAST ORGANIC, INC. 
Contact Information: 

10505-A County Road 65, Foley, AL 36535  

 

                    
Loaded 

Price: 

BALDWIN 

COUNTY 

 

MOBILE 

COUNTY 

 

ESCAMBIA 

COUNTY 

 
Bid Amount  Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 Zone-1 Zone-2 Zone-3 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Tifway 419 Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Tiffway 419 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Overseeded with Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Perennial Ryegrass Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Bermuda Celebration Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Centipede Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Centipede Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Construction Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Grade Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Geo Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Emerald Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Empire Palisade Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Zoysia Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

St. Augustine Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Small Roll Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Pallet (Slab-cut, 24”x16”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Seashore Slab-cut Pallet Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Paspalme Large Roll (42”) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Large Roll Core Deposit EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Mini Roll (2’ x 5’) SY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 



 

 

GULF COAST ORGANIC  

March 14, 2018 

PINE STRAW & HAYGULF COAST ORGANIC, INC. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

End of Tabulation 

PINE STRAW 

Dimension of Bale: 14”x 14”x 26” 

Price: $4.50 ea 

________________ 

Pick Up Location: 

10505-A County Road 65 

Foley, Alabama 36535 

 

HAY 

NO BID 


