
BID TABULATION 

“Safety Items For Employee Protection”  -  2020-2023 

BID ITEM: 
AIRGAS USA, LLC 
Mobile, AL 

POSITEC USA, INC. 
Charlotte, NC 

WINZEER 
Plano, TX 

GULF SUPPLY 
CO.  
Mobile, AL 

GCIS SUPPLY 
CO. 
Foley, AL 

FACE MASK/RESPIRATORS 
 

$0.77 ea. 3M N95 8210 
*BID REJECTED* 

Bid form not returned 
 

*SPECS NOT MET 
No certification 

 

*BID REJECTED* 
No documentation as 

requested in RFB 

NO BID 

 

GLOVES, NITRILE – price per box of 100 gloves 
 

$10.80 
Ansel 
93-250 

  
*SPECS NOT MET 
No certification 

   NO BID 
 

SAFETY GLASSES – price each $0.76 MCR Safety CL010   
*SPECS NOT MET 
No certification 

   
NO CERTIFICATION 
ATTACHED 

 

EYE GOGGLES – price each 
 

$1.06 
MCR Safety 
2220 

  
*SPECS NOT MET 
No certification 

   NO BID 
 

FACE SHIELDS – price each $1.71 
MCR Safety 
486500 

  
*SPECS NOT MET 
No certification 

   NO BID 
 

ALCOHOL WIPES – per box of 100 $9.00 
Allegro 
1001 

  
*SPECS NOT MET 
No certification 

   NO BID 
 

HAND SANATIZER – Plastic Bottle $7.96 ea. 
12-oz bottle 
3646 Purell 

  $21.67 ea. 
16-oz bottle – 
Aktive 
Gel Sanitizer 

  NO BID 
 

HAND SANATIZER – Plastic Bottle $1.96 ea. 
4-oz bottle 
9651 Purell 

  $97.50 ea. 
1-gal bottle – 
Aktive 
Gel Sanitizer 

  NO BID 
 

HAND SANATIZER – Plastic Bottle $3.58 ea. 
8-oz bottle 
9652 Purell 

  $13.94 ea. 
8-oz bottle - 
Aktive Gel 
Sanitizer 

  NO BID 
 

HAND SANATIZER – Plastic Bottle 
 

$1.96 ea. 
4-oz bottle 
9631 Purell 

  $21.66 ea. 
16-oz bottle 
Aktive Sanitizer   

  NO BID 
 

BLEACH – Plastic Bottle – price each  
 

$7.52 ea. 
121-oz bottle 
30966 Clorox 

  NO BID    NO BID 
 

INFRARED THERMOMETER – price each $89.51 
ea. 

American Diagnostic 
Corp #429 

  NO BID    NO BID 

 

WIPES, equal to or better than Clorox Wipes $4.07 ea. 
Clorox 
35 towels in container 
7x8 

  NO PRICE GIVEN    NO BID 
 

TYVEK SUITS, COVERALL with Footies $5.22 ea. 
Dupont #400 
#TY127S WH 
 

  NO PRICE GIVEN    NO BID 
 


