TABULATION

South Alabama
Purchasing Association
(SAPA)

“ASPHALT FOR ROADS”
Bid Number: SAPA 2017-05

Bid Opening Date: Friday, August 25, 2017 at 11:00 am
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Bid

Reference TYPE OF ASPHALT MIX: Mobile Asphalt Mobile Asphalt W.0. Weaver
No:
7 % Locations:
/ % Locations: Location: Bay Bridge Rd,
Saraland, Theodore, —FC;F—' Mobile
& y: Hamilton Bivd,
/A A Bay Minette: Theodore
424A - 336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
421 Range “A/B” (TO BE PICKED-UP) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $58.00 - Ton $60.00 - Ton $59.00 -Ton
424A - 336 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/8-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
422 Range “A/B” (FURNISHED & DELIVERED) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $68.00 - Ton $70.00 - Ton $69.00 - Ton
424A - 340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
423 Range “A/B” (TO BE PICKED UP) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $56.00 - Ton $60.00 - Ton $56.00 - Ton
424a - 340 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1/2-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
423 Range “A/B” (FURNISHED & DELIVERED) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $66.00 - Ton $70.00 - Ton $66.00 - Ton
424A ~ 341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
434 Range “A/B” (TO BE PICKED UP) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $50.00 - Ton $57.00 - Ton $54.00 - Ton
424a - 341 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
435 Range “A/B” (FURNISHED & DELIVERED) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $60.00 - Ton $67.00 - Ton $64.00 - Ton
424B - 635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
4.3.6 Range "A/B” (TO BE PICKED UP) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $50.00 - Ton $57.00 - Ton $54.00 - Ton
424B - 635 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 3/4-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
437 Range “A/B” (FURNISHED & DELIVERED) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $60.00 - Ton $67.00 - Ton $64.00 - Ton
424B - 636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
438 Range "A/B” (TO BE PICKED UP) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $48.00 - Ton $55.00 - Ton $51.00 - Ton
424B - 636 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix, ESAL
439 Range "A/B” (FURNISHED & DELIVERED) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $58.00 - Ton 65.00 - Ton $61.00 - Ton
424B ~ 637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1-1/2-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,
4.3.10 ESAL Range “A/B” (TO BE PICKED UP) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $48.00 - Ton $55.00 - Ton $51.00 - Ton
424B - 637 Superpave Bituminous Concrete Wearing Surface Layer, 1-1/2-inch Maximum Aggregate Size Mix,
4311 ESAL Range "A/B” (FURNISHED & DELIVERED) per ton (Minimum-25 tons per order) $58.00 - Ton $65.00 - Ton $61.00 - Ton
4312 Cold Mix Asphalt (patch) Furnished only (TO BE PICKED UP) 35-Ib. bag $14.50 - 40 Ib/bag $1?67b0a;;40 No Bid
4313 Cold Mix Asphalt (patch) Furnished only (TO BE PICKED UP) 50-Ib. bag No Bid No Bid No Bid
4314 Plant Mix — Type 1 per ton (DELIVERED) meeting all ALDOT specifications No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.3.15 Piant Mix — Type 1 per ton (LOADED AT PLANT) meeting all ALDOT specifications No Bid No Bid No Bid
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To my knowledge, this is a true and accurate tabulation.

Dl i

Wayne Smith,
SAPA Coordinator
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